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DESCRIPTION
Bariatric surgery has emerged as a significant intervention for 
individuals struggling with severe obesity, offering a pathway to 
significant weight loss and improved metabolic health. However, 
while these procedures can lead to transformative outcomes, 
they also entail certain risks and potential complications. One 
such complication that warrants attention is the development or 
exacerbation of Fatty Liver Disease (FLD) following bariatric 
surgery. Fatty liver disease encompasses a spectrum of conditions 
characterized by the accumulation of fat within the liver cells. 
The two primary forms of FLD are Non-Alcoholic Fatty Liver 
Disease (NAFLD) and its more severe manifestation, Non-
Alcoholic Steatohepatitis (NASH). NAFLD is often considered a 
benign condition, characterized by excess fat deposition in the 
liver in the absence of significant inflammation or liver damage. 
However, when NAFLD progresses to NASH, it entails 
inflammation and liver cell injury, potentially leading to fibrosis, 
cirrhosis, and even liver failure.

Bariatric surgery, including procedures such as gastric bypass, 
sleeve gastrectomy, and adjustable gastric banding, can induce 
profound weight loss and metabolic improvements in individuals 
with obesity. These metabolic changes often result in remission 
or improvement of obesity-related comorbidities, including type 
2 diabetes, hypertension, and obstructive sleep apnea. However, 
emerging evidence suggests that bariatric surgery may also impact 
the pathophysiology of FLD, both positively and negatively. On 
one hand, significant weight loss following bariatric surgery can 
lead to reductions in liver fat content and improvements in liver 
enzymes, reflecting a reversal of NAFLD. This beneficial effect is 
attributed to decreased adiposity, enhanced insulin sensitivity, 
and alterations in adipokine and cytokine profiles. On the other 
hand, rapid weight loss and alterations in nutrient absorption 
and metabolism post-surgery may exacerbate certain risk factors 
for FLD, such as nutritional deficiencies, rapid fluctuations in 
insulin levels, and changes in gut microbiota composition. 
Patients with obesity often have underlying NAFLD prior to 
surgery, which may progress to NASH or worsen following 
bariatric procedures. The rapid and significant weight loss 
experienced after bariatric surgery can trigger metabolic changes

that influence liver fat metabolism and may contribute to the 
development of FLD.

Malabsorption of essential nutrients, particularly fat-soluble 
vitamins and proteins, post-bariatric surgery can impair liver 
function and exacerbate FLD. Despite improvements in insulin 
sensitivity after bariatric surgery, rapid fluctuations in insulin 
levels and glucose metabolism can contribute to hepatic lipid 
accumulation and inflammation. Bariatric surgery-induced 
changes in gut microbiota composition and diversity may impact 
liver health through alterations in bile acid metabolism, gut 
barrier function, and inflammatory pathways.

Monitoring of liver function tests, including Alanine 
Aminotransferase (ALT), Aspartate Aminotransferase (AST), and 
Gamma-Glutamyl Transferase (GGT), is essential for early 
detection of liver dysfunction or inflammation. Ensuring 
adequate intake of essential nutrients, including protein, 
vitamins, and minerals, is vital for supporting liver health and 
preventing nutritional deficiencies post-bariatric surgery. While 
weight loss is a primary goal of bariatric surgery, a gradual and 
sustainable approach is recommended to minimize the risk of 
exacerbating FLD.

Emphasizing long-term lifestyle modifications, including regular 
physical activity and a balanced diet, is essential. In cases where 
lifestyle modifications alone are insufficient, pharmacological 
interventions such as insulin sensitizers, lipid-lowering agents, 
and antioxidants may be considered to manage FLD and its 
associated metabolic complications. For individuals with 
advanced fibrosis or NASH, emerging therapies targeting 
specific pathways involved in hepatic inflammation, fibrogenesis, 
and lipid metabolism hold potential for slowing disease 
progression and reducing the risk of liver-related complications.

Addressing FLD in individual’s post-bariatric surgery is critical 
not only for mitigating immediate risks but also for safeguarding 
long-term liver health and overall well-being. Left unchecked, 
FLD can progress to more severe liver disease, including 
cirrhosis, hepatocellular carcinoma, and liver failure, imposing 
significant morbidity and mortality burdens. By adopting a 
proactive approach to FLD management and prioritizing
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multidisciplinary care involving hepatologists, bariatric surgeons, 
dietitians, and other healthcare providers, individuals who have 
undergone bariatric surgery can optimize their metabolic outcomes

and enjoy sustained improvements in health and quality of 
life.
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