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DESCRIPTION
Short Bowel Syndrome (SBS) is a condition characterized by 
malabsorption of nutrients and fluids, resulting from a 
significant loss of small intestine, usually due to surgical 
resection. SBS can cause chronic diarrhea, weight loss, 
dehydration, malnutrition, and electrolyte imbalances. 
Nutritional management is critical in the treatment of SBS, as it 
aims to maintain fluid and electrolyte balance, prevent 
malnutrition, and optimize the nutritional status of patients. In 
this article, we will discuss the nutritional management of SBS, 
including dietary modifications, enteral and parenteral 
nutrition, and other therapeutic strategies. Dietary modifications 
are often the first-line approach to manage SBS. The goal of 
dietary modifications is to reduce the load on the remaining 
intestine and promote optimal nutrient absorption. Patients 
with SBS require an individualized dietary plan, based on their 
specific needs, symptoms, and intestinal function. The diet 
should be rich in nutrients and calories, but easy to digest and 
absorb.

Patients with SBS should consume frequent, small meals 
throughout the day to minimize the stress on the remaining 
intestine. The diet should be low in fat and fiber, as these can 
exacerbate diarrhea and malabsorption. High-quality protein 
sources, such as lean meats, fish, eggs, and dairy products, 
should be included to prevent protein malnutrition. 
Carbohydrates should come from easily digestible sources, such 
as rice, pasta, and bread. Patients may also benefit from avoiding 
lactose-containing foods, as lactose intolerance is common in 
SBS patients. Enteral Nutrition (EN) is the preferred mode of 
nutritional support for SBS patients who have some functional 
small intestine remaining. EN involves the administration of 

 
inserted through the nose, mouth, or surgically placed directly 
into the intestine. EN provides the gut with the necessary

nutrients, stimulates the growth of the intestinal mucosa, and 
improves the absorption capacity of the remaining intestine.

EN can be administered continuously or intermittently, 
depending on the individual patient's needs. Continuous EN is 
usually preferred in patients with high output stomas, while 
intermittent EN is more suitable for those with lower intestinal 
output. EN formulas should be carefully selected, based on the 
patient's individual needs and tolerance. High-calorie, high-
protein formulas are often recommended, along with electrolyte 
supplements and vitamins. Parenteral Nutrition (PN) is used in 
SBS patients who have extensive small intestine resection or who 
cannot tolerate EN. PN involves the administration of nutrients 
directly into the bloodstream, bypassing the gastrointestinal 
tract. PN is usually administered via a central venous catheter 
and requires close monitoring of electrolyte and fluid balance. 
PN is associated with a higher risk of complications, such as 
catheter-related infections, liver dysfunction, and metabolic 
abnormalities. Therefore, PN should be used cautiously, and the 
benefits and risks should be carefully weighed for each patient. 
PN is typically used as a short-term intervention to improve 
nutritional status and allow for intestinal adaptation.

In addition to dietary modifications and nutritional support, 
other therapeutic strategies may be useful in the management of 
SBS. These include:

• Probiotics may help improve intestinal function and reduce
the risk of bacterial overgrowth, which is common in SBS
patients.

• Glucagon-like peptide-2 (GLP-2) analogues are a novel
therapeutic option that can improve intestinal adaptation,
increase nutrient absorption, and reduce intestinal
inflammation.

• In some cases, surgical interventions, such as intestinal
lengthening or bowel transplantation, may be necessary to
manage SBS.
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