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DESCRIPTION
Merchandising is any type of in-store advertising, excluding 
personal selling, that aims to influence customer behaviour. "The 
silent salesman" has been used to describe it. Selling has evolved 
into a "scientific art." It is scientific because it is possible to 
predictably alter consumer behaviour. It is an art because these 
well-known patterns can only be manipulated for the benefit of 
the merchant and producer through the inventive use of a 
constantly evolving range of approaches.

Examining consumer disposal behaviour, this research addresses 
the issues of charity merchandising and rivalry for used items. It 
focuses on products sold by charitable shops and advances 
disposal research by describing the various disposal procedures 
used by households. On the basis of 210 homes responses to a 
postal survey, descriptive study is presented. A hierarchical 
cluster analysis employing the Jaccard coefficient is carried out to 
identify homes based on the items disposed and the channels 
used. Descriptive statistics are employed to demonstrate disposal 
trends. The findings demonstrate that households use a diverse 
portfolio of disposal channels within and across categories of 
commodities, and that the events that motivate disposition 
(decorating, buying, and bereavement) have a major impact on 
disposal. With regard to the channels utilized in combination 
and the commodities used in combination that are abandoned, 
five different types of households are distinguished. Targeting 
activities for charity merchants could be expanded and improved 
to improve procurement, allowing for the pursuit of ever-more 
complex retail strategies.

The majority of producers of well-known branded consumer 
goods rely on advertising as well as merchandising at the point of 
sale to pre-sell their items. Yet, there have been notable triumphs 
that have been attained only through merchandising on 
occasion. The British scone company McVities originally introduced

a variety of cakes to the UK market using simply merchandising 
and earned a highly lucrative 15% share of the market, second 
only to Lyons, which had 25% of the market.

Why marketing is effective?

Merchandising is effective because it increases the appeal and 
visibility of products: the more desirable a product is made to 
look, the more likely it is to be seen and purchased; the more 
visible a product is, the more likely it is to be seen and purchased.

Benefits of merchandising

The two main benefits of merchandising are:

• It is one of the most economically efficient promotional
strategies. It can result in surprisingly significant revenue
growth at a modest cost.

• It affects customers at the moment of sale, where they are
making their final purchasing decisions.

Merchandising incorporates a particular point of view that is 
defined by the following characteristics: organizing store 
activities to achieve goals, guaranteeing client satisfaction under 
conditions of maximum responsibility;

Client orientation: Because the customer is the beginning point 
of every shop's activity, internal organization must be done with 
the customer in mind; seeing the shop as a system in which the 
actions of one element have an impact on the collection of 
related items.

Change: The shop is a living organism located in a dynamic 
social-economic context; this calls for the management to 
demonstrate the ability to adapt to changes in the environment; 
Innovation: The shop is not just a straightforward middleman 
between producers and customers. The latter group waits for 
concepts, knowledge, and various satisfactions.
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