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Dear Sir, 

Lamotrigine is a first drug since lithium approved for maintenance 
treatment of bipolar type I. Lamotrigine-induced extrapyramidal side 
effects are rarely reported in literatures. In this letter, we have presented 
a case of Bipolar disorder which has induced dystonia to lamotrigine. 
Lamotrigine is a phenyltriazine derivative [1] which was originally 
approved by USA Food & Drug Administration for partial complex 
and generalized seizures. It was also recommended for treating bipolar 
affective disorder by British association for psychopharmacology in 
2009 [2]. Lamotrigine is generally well tolerated. However, the most 
common adverse effects due to lamotrigine are nausea, headache, 
dizziness, ataxia, diplopia, somnolence, and tremor. Beside these, 
skin eruptions, arthralgia, haematological abnormalities comprised 
of leucopenia and thrombocytopenia, and elevated liver enzymes are 
also reported [3]. Some psychiatric problems are also associated with 
lamotrigine use, which are rarely reported in literature. 

In this letter, a male patient of 21 year was reported from psychiatry 
department of Gauhati medical college and hospital, Guwahati, 
Northeast India. There was no history of psychotic symptoms and family 
history of mental illness. He had history of sleep decreased, nocturnal 
awakenings, loss of appetite and weight, hearing voices, and low mood. 
He was born by natural vaginal delivery, with no perinatal complications. 
He was well-kempt and cooperative. His speech was also spontaneous 
and fluent. He had reactive affect and negative cognition during periods 
of low mood. He was also expressing death wish. Physical examination 
was always normal, but with noticeable weight loss during his certain 
low mood exacerbations. He was admitted to this hospital in psychiatry 
ward which was referred for psychiatry evaluation with anxiety and 
depressive symptoms and failure to respond antidepressant treatment 
which was prescribed by general practitioner. He was diagnosed with 
bipolar affective disorder and failure to achieve remission of symptoms 
on two different antipsychotic medications (quetiapine and olanzapine) 
and anticonvulsant medication (valproic acid). 

It was decided to introduce lithium carbonate with gradual titration 
and he perceived improvement in his symptoms and mood stabilised. 
However, few months later he reported relapse in his symptoms despite 
adequate lithium level. Lamotrigine was introduced as add-on therapy 
to lithium with 25 mg daily for two weeks and later on it was increased 
to 50 mg/day. A few days after lamotrigine dose was increased to 100 
mg/day, thereafter patient showed agitated behaviour, and experienced 
disturbed sleep. Patient also had pain and stiffness in his neck and 
jaw along with muscle spasms in extremities. Upon learning these 
symptoms, the dose of lamotrigine was reduced to 50 mg which resulted 
into immediate reduction in the intensity of neck and jaw dystonic 
reactions. After few days, lamotrigine with 100 mg daily dose was 
again reintroduced with an aim to stabilize his mood and next day he 
again developed acute dystonic reactions. Thus, these reoccurrence of 
symptoms were suspected to cause by lamotrigine, and were eventually 
subsided after 1 week with lamotrigine withdrawal. Response to 
withdrawal of drug was clinically reasonable and phenomenologically 
found definite. Event was with plausible time relationship to drug 
intake and was unlikely to be attributed to disease. Therefore, by WHO-
Uppsala Monitoring Centre (UMC) causality assessment system [4], 
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the causal relationship between these reaction and lamotrigine was 
certain whereas by Naranjo probability assessment algorithm [4], it was 
found probable. 

Antipsychotic agent-induced extrapyramidal side effects are well 
known and are most commonly reported adverse effect during clinical 
practice. However, anticonvulsant drugs induced extrapyramidal 
symptoms are rarely reported due to lack of awareness about this drug 
reaction [5]. In this letter, patient has induced dystonia comprised of 
stiffness and muscle spasms over neck and jaw involving extremities. 
These symptoms are usually induced by antipsychotic  drugs that 
antagonize dopamine D2 receptors. Moreover, co-administration 
of lithium and lamotrigine at higher doses hasn’t precipitated 
extrapyramidal symptoms in majority of the bipolar patients. However, 
this patient has developed acute dystonia after dose increment of 
lamotrigine in the presence of lithium. Even if the prodystonic effect of 
lithium acted synergistically to develop dystonic reaction, it seems that 
inclusion of lamotrigine in the treatment was the catalyst. Thus, this 
increase in dosage may likely to have aggravated his symptoms, which 
were subsided soon after discontinuing lamotrigine. Lamotrigine 
induced dystonia was initially reported in hamster model by Richter 
et al. [6]. It was reported that inhibition of GABA release and lack of 
selectivity for glutamate release inhibition are critically involved in 
prodystonic tendencies of lamotrigine. This excessive glutamate release 
may over stimulate the brain and introduce  excitotoxicity [6]. In a 
review of literature of Villari et al. case reports of psychiatric symptoms 
related to lamotrigine use are presented in four categories; affective 
switches in depressive patients, hallucinations in depressive patients, 
psychotic episodes in patients with epilepsy and hallucinations in a 
patient with epilepsy [7]. Most of these cases were concluded on the 
basis of favourable course showed by the patient following withdrawal 
of lamotrigine. Similarly in this patient, dystonia was subsided upon 
withdrawal of lamotrigine. However, further studies are required which 
can provide underlying mechanism in lamotrigine-induced dystonia.
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