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DESCRIPTION
This study examine the empirical literature to determine which 
variables are proposed to influence ethical views and decision 
making. The factors are classified as those that are unique to the 
particular decision maker and those that are situational in 
character. Nationality, religion, gender, age, education, 
employment, and personality are variables associated to an 
individual decision maker explored here. This paper looks at 
situational variables such as referent groups, rewards and 
sanctions, rules of conduct, types of ethical conflict, 
organizational effects, industry, and business competitiveness. 
They examines the variables that have been empirically evaluated 
in order to discover what is known and what we need to know 
about the variables considered to be determinants of ethical 
decision behaviour.

Marketing ethics has received considerable scholarly attention in 
recent years, particularly in the last ten years. The development 
of models, or frameworks, for examining ethical decision making 
in marketing has been one area of study in the topic. Few of the 
models have been empirically tested. Furthermore, the existing 
frameworks have some drawbacks. This paper covers the findings 
of a field test of an alternative approach for studying ethical 
decision making in marketing. The study's findings indicate that 
the framework has promise as a tool for studying marketers 
ethical decision making.

This study highlights a plethora of empirical studies that evaluate 
ethical decision making in business and recommends more study 
to advance theory in this area. The investigations are organized 
into categories and linked to contemporary theoretical ethical 
decision-making models. The research is concerned with 
awareness, individual and organizational characteristics, intent, 
and the role of moral intensity in ethical decision making.

Summary tables make it easy to access information about the 
sample, conclusions, and publication channel. This gives insights 
for understanding organizational ethical decision constructions, 
where ethical decision making theory now stands, and what 
future empirical study on organizational ethical decision making 
should look like.

Most contemporary ethical decision-making models offer a 
logical and reasoned procedure for forming ethical judgements, 
however these models are empirically unproven and rely on 
rational, conscious, and quasilegal reasoning assumptions.

Despite the reality that numerous nonrational factors influence 
ethical thought and action, such as environment, perceptions, 
relationships, emotions, and heuristics, such models 
predominate. A substantial body of behavioural research, for 
example, has established the significance of automatic intuitive 
and emotive processes in decision making and judgement. These 
mechanisms have a tremendous impact on human behaviour, 
resulting in systematic biases and deviations from normative 
rationality theories. Their effect is a significant but generally 
unacknowledged component of ethical decision making.

There is a scarcity of theoretical and empirical study on the 
process of ethical decision making in the field of Information 
Systems (IS). It explain and test a generic ethical decision-making 
theory established in the marketing discipline as a first step in 
this direction. They conducted a study on the ethical decision-
making process of 243 entry-level information security 
professionals when it came to softlifting, or illegally copying 
software for personal use. The findings support the application of 
the tested ethical decision-making theory to the area of IS, 
specifically softlifting. To arriving at an ethical judgement of a 
moral issue, entry-level IT professionals were shown to apply both 
deontological and teleological analyses.
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