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Introduction 

Burnout is still not being taken as seriously as it should be. Burnout 
is a worldwide dilemma in the social work profession. Articles were 
reviewed from Italy, England, Korea and the United States. Burnout 
in health care professionals continues to gain attention, in particular 
within the social work profession. Burnout seems to be particularly 
prevalent among mental health social workers who work with 
marginalized populations. These social workers (SW) work with 
vulnerable people, and these populations can have heavy emotional 
burdens on workers, especially in areas that have fewer resources. 
This often results in the work feeling physically and mentally 
exhausting. 

The literature looks at different themes that contribute to burnout 
for community mental health workers. The work they do is so 
important; they are the leaders in helping marginalized populations 
reintegrate into society through work, housing, school and family 
connections. This does take a lot of time, effort, energy and 
emotions on the part of the worker; however, most of the studies 
founds that workers’ burnout was not correlated with the 
population they serve. Some of the major themes leading to 
burnout were found to be disconnection from managers and the 
organization as a whole. Burnout leads to high turnover, resulting in 
poor staff retention, which directly impacts the care clients are 
receiving (Salyer, 2015). The goal of this review is to provide an 
overview of the impact of burnout on client care.
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