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DESCRIPTION
Hepatocellular Carcinoma (HCC) is one of the leading causes of 
cancer. As a result there is an ongoing effort to enhance 
screening, diagnostic and treatment options in order to improve 
the prognosis of this cancer. Despite varying cut-off points, 
current serum biomarkers exhibit low sensitivity and diverse 
specificity especially when tested longitudinally with a group of 
serum biomarkers. HCC biomarkers employed for prognostic 
purposes on the other hand may play a larger clinical role in the 
near future [1]. Additionally several serum biomarkers have 
already been identified as a therapy screening method whether 
to offer access to specific medicines or to guide therapy selection. 
Hepatocellular Carcinoma (HCC) is now one of the most 
common cancers and a leading cause of mortality worldwide 
throughout the last few decades there have been some 
advancements in the therapeutic strategy for both early and 
advanced HCC stages. On the contrary no major clinical 
improvement in HCC biomarkers for screening and early 
diagnosis has occurred.

These biomarkers on the other hand may play a clinical function 
in prognosis and therapy response. Despite the fact that various 
serum or tissue biomarkers have been investigated, their clinical 
value has not been broadly accepted [2]. One of the most 
significant concerns and possibly its Biggest weakness is their low 
sensitivity which precludes HCC biomarkers from being 
therapeutically effective for early HCC detection. The majority 
of these indicators have been linked to a poor prognosis in 
either early or advanced HCC. Furthermore tumor indicators 
for optimal therapy selection or response have received a lot of 
attention in recent years. Even with the introduction of new 
therapeutic oncologic methods such as immunotherapy with 
targeted therapies , new biomarkers, with the exception of 
Alpha-Feto Protein (AFP) have yet to become commonplace. As 
a result, it is to create new biomarkers for early diagnosis, 
appropriate patient therapy selection, and post-treatment 
prognosis, such as proteomics, metabolomics, genomes and 
other novel biomarkers like micro biome [3]. Although the 
evidence-based data for HCC surveillance is limited to

moderate, with only two randomized trials in patients with 
chronic hepatitis B infection with a significant risk of bias and 
several observational studies in cirrhosis, surveillance for HCC is 
widely recommended by international guidelines. Many 
epidemiological grounds back up this recommendation. HCC 
constitutes a major threat to public health, current being the 
fourth cancer-related cause of death worldwide. Patients with 
chronic hepatitis B (HBV) or C virus (HCV) as well as people 
with any chronic liver disease with severe fibrosis or cirrhosis are 
among  those  at  risk. It  should  be  mentioned that the evidence 
for HCC surveillance is moderate in chronic HBV patients and 
weak in cirrhotic patients[4] . There were no randomized 
controlled trials that assessed the survival benefit of HCC 
surveillance in cirrhotic patients, and in some studies. However, 
due to the ethical issues associated with running a study with a 
non-interventional arm, current recommendations are based on 
the existing evidence. The discovery of an alternative biomarker 
capable of detecting early-stage and conventional tumour marker-
negative  HCC  is  critical  [5].  Protein  Kinase  C  delta (PKC) is  
preferentially released into extracellular space from HCC cell 
lines and promotes to tumor growth and its blood levels are 
higher in HCC patients. T efficacy of serum PKC for detecting 
HCC in Chronic Liver Disease (CLD) patients.
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